

717 TEXAS AVENUE, SUITE 2800

Houston, TX 77002 TEL: 202.429.3000 www.steptoe.com

\$

498,557.85

11 July 2024

HENNEPIN COUNTY ATTORNEY 300 South Sixth Street Minneapolis, MN 55487 UNITED STATES

Total Amount Due

INVOICE SUMMARY

Our Matter No. 126344.00001	Invoice No. 30	079440
Hennepin County Steptoe May-June Invoice		
For professional services in connection with the above matter.		
Total Fees	\$ 482,550.00	
Total Expenses	16,007.85	

FEE SUMMARY

Timekeeper	Hours	Rate
Maloney, K.G.	98.35	850.00
Poscablo, R.P.	49.60	850.00
Bromwich, M.R.	106.65	850.00
Levin, S.H.	123.70	850.00
Adibi, I.	6.50	850.00
Ashong, M.	116.35	850.00
Davis, C.	42.60	850.00
Arnold, L.E.	79.60	250.00
Hernandez, B.	1.35	250.00
Mitchell, K.G.	0.50	250.00

Total Hours 625.20

FEE DETAIL

Date	Timekeeper	Hours	Description
1-May-24	Poscablo, R.P.	1.00	Call with client and team.
1-May-24	Bromwich, M.R.	2.80	Telephone call with S. Davis; draft agenda for call with Hennepin City Officials; conference call with M. Moriarty, S. Davis et al. regarding agenda items; emails regarding experts; emails regarding; review
1-May-24	Levin, S.H.	3.50	Preparation for hearing; communications with HCAO; review of case- related materials.
1-May-24	Ashong, M.	3.80	Review and analyze discovery; meeting with client; confer with I. Adibi and J. Dupre regarding same.
2-May-24	Bromwich, M.R.	0.50	Emails with team members; emails with defense counsel regarding exhibits, meet and confer; review
2-May-24	Levin, S.H.	3.40	Preparation for hearing; communications with counsel; and review of case-related materials.
2-May-24	Ashong, M.	4.90	Review and analyze discovery; confer with trial team regarding same.
2-May-24	Arnold, L.E.	4.50	Review and respond to email correspondence with Hennepin Special Prosecutor team regarding discovery documents and processing; continue work in connection with indexing Reports & Attachments documents provided by client; print to PDF and save to
2-May-24	Mitchell, K.G.	0.50	Confer with M. Ashong regarding external drive data and coordinate pick up and directory listing.
3-May-24	Poscablo, R.P.	2.25	Email to team regarding associate team and additional work product; call with co-counsel to discuss review of documents, status of case, and open items including various motions.

Date	Timekeeper	Hours	Description
3-May-24	Bromwich, M.R.	3.30	Team meeting; draft and edit Davis; begin reviewing ; attempts to locate Pannell; emails with J. Kimball regarding edits on document; review .
3-May-24	Levin, S.H.	2.70	Review of case-related materials in preparation for hearing/trial.
3-May-24	Ashong, M.	3.70	Meeting with C. Davis regarding case facts and strategy; meeting with M. Bromwich, S. Levin, R. Poscablo regarding case planning and strategy; meet with R. Poscablo, C. Davis, I. Adibi regarding document file management strategy and vendor; review and analyze discovery.
3-May-24	Davis, C.	1.00	Strategize regarding ; analyze ; confer with M. Ashong regarding same.
5-May-24	Levin, S.H.	1.20	Review of case-related materials in preparation for upcoming hearings.
5-May-24	Ashong, M.	1.10	Review and analyze discovery.
6-May-24	Poscablo, R.P.	2.25	Team call to discuss ; call with client; call with M. Ashong regarding ; call with S. Levin regarding ; emails with team regarding .
6-May-24	Bromwich, M.R.	3.00	Prepare for team meeting; team meeting; emails regarding; meeting; emails regarding; meeting with M. Moriarty, S. Davis, J. Larson, C. Freeman regarding various topics; emails with defense counsel; emails with team members.
6-May-24	Levin, S.H.	4.00	Telephone call with counsel; strategy session; review of materials relevant to upcoming hearings.
6-May-24	Ashong, M.	6.50	Review and analyze discovery; team strategy meeting; meeting with client, debrief from meeting with client; draft .
6-May-24	Davis, C.	1.50	Confer with counsel team regarding status of evidence review,
6-May-24	Arnold, L.E.	4.30	Attend case team Zoom meeting to discuss to do list and next steps; work in connection with case management; review and respond to email correspondence with Hennepin Special Prosecutor team regarding discovery documents and admission pro hac vice; work in connection regarding same; research Minnesota pro hac vice admission requirements; draft and respond to email correspondence with M. Bromwich regarding same; continue work in connection with indexing Reports & Attachments documents provided by client.
7-May-24	Poscablo, R.P.	1.50	Telephone call with investigation team; discussion of next steps, etc.; emails concerning
7-May-24	Bromwich, M.R.	2.80	Emails with K. Maloney; emails with team members; begin review of ; emails with team members regarding same; draft email to .
7-May-24	Levin, S.H.	4.30	Trial preparation; review of materials, discovery.
7-May-24	Ashong, M.	3.70	Meeting with vendor; review and analyze discovery.

Date	Timekeeper	Hours	Description
7-May-24	Arnold, L.E.	4.30	Work in connection with case management; review and respond to email correspondence with Hennepin Special Prosecutor team regarding discovery documents and admission pro hac vice; work in connection regarding same; continue research and work in connection with preparing Minnesota pro have vice admission materials; draft and respond to email correspondence with M. Burke and A. Taylor regarding obtaining certificates of good standing; continue work in connection with indexing Reports & Attachments documents provided by client; telephone conference with M. Ashong regarding criminal case files; work in connection with downloading case docket sheet and begin to download pleadings.
8-May-24	Poscablo, R.P.	3.75	Review of grading same; emails with team regarding team call to review evidence; emails and calls to discuss grading; review of draft statement; meeting with K. Putney; telephone call with client; call with team; email to K. Putney; review grading discovery and other evidence.
8-May-24	Bromwich, M.R.	2.00	Review ; discussion with K. Putney; draft statements ; emails with team members; review ; emails regarding ;
8-May-24	Levin, S.H.	3.00	Review of case-related materials in preparation for trial; various communications with counsel and client.
8-May-24	Ashong, M.	4.50	Meeting with client; debrief from meeting with client; review and analyze discovery.
8-May-24	Davis, C.	0.50	Confer with team regarding hearing preparation, discovery responses, and evidence review.
8-May-24	Arnold, L.E.	2.70	Continue work in connection with downloading Londregan criminal case pleadings from MCRO.
9-May-24	Maloney, K.G.	2.50	Begin review of and call with team regarding .
9-May-24	Poscablo, R.P.	4.30	Meeting with team to discuss motions, discovery, review of video, telephone call with client; telephone call with client and team; continued review of evidence; review of
9-May-24	Bromwich, M.R.	2.00	Emails with Cheung; emails with Hennen; emails with C. Davis; emails with C. Davis regarding
9-May-24	Levin, S.H.	5.00	Various meetings to discuss case strategy; review of case-related materials; and preparation for document production.
9-May-24	Ashong, M.	6.75	Review and analyze discovery; meeting with S. Levin and R. Poscablo regarding
9-May-24	Davis, C.	1.00	Conduct review of discovery materials.
9-May-24	Arnold, L.E.	4.75	Review and respond to email correspondence with Hennepin Special Prosecutor regarding Minnesota criminal case files, discovery documents, and admission pro hac vice updates; continue work in connection with preparing Minnesota pro hac vice admission materials and forward certificates of good standing to P. Breuer for filing; highlight case docket sheet with missing or CBI documents, forward to attorneys for review and analysis; continue work in connection with indexing Reports & Attachments documents provided by client.

Date	Timekeeper	Hours	Description
10-May-24	Maloney, K.G.	1.50	Telephone conference with Steptoe team; telephone call with defense counsel to meet and confer regarding
10-May-24	Poscablo, R.P.	1.50	Meeting with Steptoe team to discuss evidence, next steps,
10-May-24	Bromwich, M.R.	3.75	Pre-meeting conference with team members; meet and confer with defense counsel; follow-up meeting with team members; emails with C. Davis, J. Larson, C. Freeman, M. Olser.
10-May-24	Levin, S.H.	3.50	Various meetings to discuss case strategy; review of case-related materials; and preparation for document production.
10-May-24	Ashong, M.	6.00	Prepare for meeting with opposing counsel; meeting with opposing counsel; debrief from meeting with opposing counsel; review and analyze discovery; manage discovery production.
10-May-24	Davis, C.	1.75	Conduct research for upcoming hearing; confer with team regarding same.
11-May-24	Bromwich, M.R.	1.00	Review
11-May-24	Ashong, M.	1.40	Review and analyze discovery.
12-May-24	Bromwich, M.R.	1.30	Review of additional defense exhibits; draft and circulate team meeting agenda.
12-May-24	Levin, S.H.	1.50	Review of case-related materials.
12-May-24	Davis, C.	3.00	Analyze ; analyze ; conduct research regarding ; draft analysis regarding same. ;
13-May-24	Maloney, K.G.	6.00	Review of core case materials prior to Minneapolis trip; confer with team regarding
13-May-24	Poscablo, R.P.	2.50	Meeting with team to discuss response to motions, evidence, next steps; review of exhibits with M. Ashong; review of pro hac vice and affidavit for admission; review of exhibits and index of proposed exhibits; communication in advance of trip and court conference.
13-May-24	Bromwich, M.R.	2.50	Team meeting; emails with team members; emails with S. Davis; review ; begin review of admissions.
13-May-24	Levin, S.H.	2.50	Trial preparation; review of discovery and recent communications from defense counsel.
13-May-24	Ashong, M.	2.50	Internal team strategy meeting; review of ; ; meeting with R. Poscablo to discuss .
13-May-24	Davis, C.	2.90	Review .
13-May-24	Arnold, L.E.	5.50	Attend case team Zoom meeting to discuss to do list and next steps; work in connection with case management; review and respond to email correspondence with Hennepin Special Prosecutor team regarding admission pro hac vice; work in connection regarding same; draft and respond to email correspondence with M. Bromwich, S. Levin, M. Ashong, R. Poscablo, S. Davis and K. Maloney regarding same; prepare and file pro hac vice applications for Steptoe attorneys in Minnesota; telephone conference with S. Davis regarding process for admission into Minnesota courts; prepare out of state attorney affidavits for filing, as per S. Davis; continue work in connection with indexing Reports & Attachments documents provided by client; draft and send email correspondence to S. Davis, S. Daye and C. Beaton forwarding Steptoe attorney bar information and pro hac vice applications.

Date	Timekeeper	Hours	Description
14-May-24	Maloney, K.G.	0.00	Travel to Minneapolis (NO CHARGE).
14-May-24	Maloney, K.G.	4.50	Meetings with HCAO; receipt and review of discovery documents from HCAO; meetings with Special Prosecutors team.
14-May-24	Poscablo, R.P.	1.75	Review of and discussion concerning , etc., respond to same, review and revised ; review and revise email to Court regarding same.
14-May-24	Bromwich, M.R.	4.50	Travel to Minneapolis (not billed); meetings with M. Moriarty, S. Davis, C. Freeman, J. Larson; discussions with team members; meeting with J. Larson; meeting with M. Osler; discussions with C. Diegel; discussions with M. Moriarty and team.
14-May-24	Levin, S.H.	2.50	Prepare for court.
14-May-24	Ashong, M.	5.60	Review and analyze discovery regarding; meetings with HCAO prosecutors; meeting with K, Maloney, M. Bromwich.
14-May-24	Arnold, L.E.	6.10	Work in connection with case management; draft and respond to email correspondence with M. Bromwich, S. Levin, M. Ashong, R. Poscablo, S. Davis and K. Maloney regarding pro hac vice applications and affidavits; prepare and finalize out of state attorney affidavits and forward with applications for pro hac vice and approval letters to S. Davis for filing; review and respond to email correspondence with Hennepin Special Prosecution team regarding same; continue work in connection with indexing Reports & Attachments documents and folders provided by client; prepare documents for production - bates stamp, and forward to M. Ashong for production.
15-May-24	Maloney, K.G.	7.80	Attend various meetings in Minneapolis with HCAO prosecutors; telephone call with consultant; prepare for and attend hearing before Judge Garcia in the Fourth District Court.
15-May-24	Poscablo, R.P.	7.80	Prepare for court conference; review of outstanding motions; site visit with BCA; various meetings with BCA and HC; court conference; meeting with team post-conference.
15-May-24	Bromwich, M.R.	7.80	Discussions with K. Maloney, S. Levin, M. Ashong regarding various issues; meeting with Lofton; prepare for court hearing; court hearing before Judge Garcia; debrief regarding hearing with M. Moriarty et al; conference call with K. Putney.
15-May-24	Levin, S.H.	7.80	Preparation for court; meetings with witnesses and HCAO personnel.
15-May-24	Ashong, M.	7.80	Conduct physical evidence review with T. Roth, J. Larson, C. Diegel; debrief from physical evidence review; meeting with T. Roth; appear in Court on behalf of client; meeting with K. Putney along with K. Maloney, M. Bromwich, S. Levin; debrief from meeting with K. Putney.
15-May-24	Hernandez, B.	0.20	Communicate with M. Ashlong; prepared materials to be shared with expert.
16-May-24	Maloney, K.G.	0.00	Travel back to Houston (NO CHARGE).
16-May-24	Maloney, K.G.	1.80	Meetings with other Special Prosecutors and executive management at HCAO.
16-May-24	Bromwich, M.R.	1.80	Discussions with team members; meeting with C. Freeman; meeting with M. Moriarty and S. Davis; follow-up discussions with S. Davis; telephone call with S. Davis; emails with team members (travel to DC—travel time not billed).
16-May-24	Levin, S.H.	1.80	Meeting with county attorneys/personnel.

Date	Timekeeper	Hours	Description
16-May-24	Ashong, M.	3.40	Review and analyze ; debrief with C. Davis and J. Dupre.
16-May-24	Davis, C.	0.70	Confer with team regarding evidence review and
16-May-24	Arnold, L.E.	3.20	Work in connection with case management; review and respond to email correspondence with M. Bromwich and M. Ashong regarding ; continue work in connection with indexing Reports & Attachments documents and folders provided by client; work in connection with updating pleadings files, downloading pleadings, orders and motions filed in Londregan case and updating files; draft email to team forwarding orders granting admission pro hac vice.
17-May-24	Maloney, K.G.	0.75	Team meeting to discuss
17-May-24	Maloney, K.G.	3.50	Further review of case materials; revisions to
17-May-24	Poscablo, R.P.	0.75	Telephone call with team to discuss next steps post-Court conference; telephone calls with S. Levin, K. Maloney and M. Bromwich.
17-May-24	Bromwich, M.R.	3.50	Draft ; emails with K. Maloney, S. Davis; team meeting regarding ; emails regarding ; draft .
17-May-24	Levin, S.H.	3.50	Review of materials; preparation of
17-May-24	Hernandez, B.	0.40	Prepare files to be shared with expert.
18-May-24	Maloney, K.G.	2.50	Further review of case materials related to experts, videos and investigative history; work on
18-May-24	Bromwich, M.R.	2.50	Emails with team members; revise ;
18-May-24	Ashong, M.	1.20	Review and analyze action together with attachments ; telephone conversation with BCA Agent T. Roth.
19-May-24	Bromwich, M.R.	2.30	Continue ; draft agenda for team meeting; emails with team members.
20-May-24	Maloney, K.G.	0.50	Internal team meeting.
20-May-24	Bromwich, M.R.	4.80	Weekly team meeting; continue discussions with K. Maloney, S. Levin; emails with T. Roth; emails with M. Moriarty, S. Davis.
20-May-24	Levin, S.H.	5.00	Review of materials; response to various defense requests; communications with co-counsel; analysis of case; preparation
20-May-24	Ashong, M.	0.50	Internal team strategy meeting.
20-May-24	Davis, C.	1.25	Confer with team regarding task priorities; review assist with . ;
20-May-24	Arnold, L.E.	3.00	Attend case team Zoom meeting to discuss to do list and next steps; work in connection with case management; review and respond to email correspondence with M. Ashong regarding work in connection with preparation of documents for production; forward to M. Ashong for production; review and respond to email correspondence with team regarding next steps; review and respond to email correspondence with defense counsel and M. Bromwich regarding trial exhibits; conduct research regarding as per M. Bromwich and forward to M. Bromwich for attorney review and analysis.

Date	Timekeeper	Hours	Description
20-May-24	Hernandez, B.	0.50	Downloaded files and created
21-May-24	Maloney, K.G.	4.00	Further review of discovery; draft , other
21-May-24	Bromwich, M.R.	4.75	Continue drafting ; begin drafting
			; research on ; emails with team members regarding , logistics; emails with C. Davis.
21-May-24	Levin, S.H.	1.50	Review of materials; response to various defense requests; communications with co-counsel; analysis of case; preparation
21-May-24	Ashong, M.	4.00	Review and analyze documents ; correspond with M. Bromwich regarding same; draft ; confer with S. Levin regarding same.
21-May-24	Arnold, L.E.	3.50	Work in connection with case management; review and respond to email correspondence with M. Bromwich regarding work in connection with ; review and respond to email correspondence with M. Bromwich regarding ; draft and respond to email correspondence with K. Maloney and N. Girma regarding respond to email correspondence with M. Bromwich regarding ; work in connection with ; forward to attorneys for review and analysis; work in connection with downloading and updating files with Minnesota court pleadings filed.
22-May-24	Maloney, K.G.	3.50	Review of , and draft .
22-May-24	Maloney, K.G.	1.00	Call with clients (HCAO).
22-May-24	Bromwich, M.R.	3.00	Finish drafting ; emails with K. Maloney; discussion with Shapiro; emails with team members regarding ; conference call with M. Moriarty, S. Davis et al.; telephone calls and emails regarding ; emails with team members regarding .
22-May-24	Levin, S.H.	5.00	Review of materials; response to various defense requests; communications with co-counsel; analysis of case; preparation
22-May-24	Ashong, M.	2.75	Attend meeting with client; review and analyze discovery correspond with S. Levin regarding discovery production; correspond with K. Maloney regarding discovery production.
22-May-24	Davis, C.	4.25	Draft and revise ; analyze .
23-May-24	Maloney, K.G.	4.00	Write ; review case materials for .
23-May-24	Maloney, K.G.	1.00	Hearing before Judge M. Kappelhoff; advance call beforehand with M. Bromwich.
23-May-24	Poscablo, R.P.	1.00	Telephone call with team to discuss production and review of ; discussions with team regarding a variety of issues.
23-May-24	Bromwich, M.R.	4.75	Prepare transcripts of the state of the stat
23-May-24	Levin, S.H.	5.00	Review of materials; response to various defense requests; communications with co-counsel; analysis of case; preparation

Date	Timekeeper	Hours	Description
23-May-24	Ashong, M.	4.50	Attend bench conference with Judge Kappelhoff; draft notes regarding same; participate in interview of J. Larson; confer with C. Diegel regarding discovery productions; confer with K. Maloney, S. Levin, M. Bromwich regarding discovery productions; prepare discovery package and produce same to defense counsel; confer with K. Maloney, S. Levin, M. Bromwich regarding ; review and analyze
23-May-24	Davis, C.	0.75	Confer with client and team regarding
23-May-24	Arnold, L.E.	2.50	Work in connection with case management; review and respond to email correspondence with M. Ashong regarding; work in connection with preparation of documents for production; forward to M. Ashong for production; review and respond to email correspondence with defense counsel regarding request for conference to discuss trial technologies and exhibits; review and respond to email correspondence with R. Poscablo, S. Levin and M. Bromwich regarding same; review and respond to email correspondence with K. Maloney regarding materials and Hennepin County Attorney's Office discovery materials; work in connection with copying discovery materials to
24-May-24	Maloney, K.G.	6.50	Write ; review case materials for .
24-May-24	Maloney, K.G.	0.50	Review defense filing related to
24-May-24	Poscablo, R.P.	0.50	Emails with team concerning
24-May-24	Bromwich, M.R.	3.00	; emails regarding ; review ; review .
24-May-24	Levin, S.H.	6.00	Review of materials; response to various defense requests; communications with co-counsel; analysis of case; preparation
24-May-24	Ashong, M.	1.00	Confer with C. Davis regarding ; conduct interview of BCA Special Agent T. Roth.
24-May-24	Davis, C.	0.75	Confer with team regarding priority tasks and correspondence with client.
25-May-24	Maloney, K.G.	7.00	Write confer with M. Ashong about
25-May-24	Bromwich, M.R.	1.50	Continue ; emails regarding same.
25-May-24	Levin, S.H.	4.00	Review of materials; response to various defense requests; communications with co-counsel; analysis of case; preparation
25-May-24	Ashong, M.	5.75	Review and analyze ; review and analyze ; draft report regarding same; review and analyze ; summarize .
26-May-24	Maloney, K.G.	6.50	Write
26-May-24	Maloney, K.G.	0.50	Telephone call with team to discuss .
26-May-24	Levin, S.H.	4.00	Review of materials; response to various defense requests; communications with co-counsel; analysis of case; preparation

Date	Timekeeper	Hours	Description
27-May-24	Maloney, K.G.	2.50	Further work on .
27-May-24	Maloney, K.G.	0.75	Team meeting to discuss and other upcoming tasks.
27-May-24	Bromwich, M.R.	5.00	Telephone calls with K. Putney; emails with team members; review and edit ; emails regarding same.
27-May-24	Levin, S.H.	6.50	Review of materials; response to various defense requests; communications with co-counsel; analysis of case; preparation
27-May-24	Ashong, M.	3.00	Weekly strategy meeting; review and analyze ; participate in
27-May-24	Davis, C.	0.75	Draft .
28-May-24	Maloney, K.G.	0.50	Meeting with team to discuss upcoming tasks and progress.
28-May-24	Maloney, K.G.	6.00	Continue drafting sections of .
28-May-24	Poscablo, R.P.	1.50	Telephone call with team to discuss ; call with C. Freeman to discuss .
28-May-24	Bromwich, M.R.	3.75	Team meeting call; emails with team members; emails with S. Davis; assemble ; review documents circulated by K. Maloney.
28-May-24	Levin, S.H.	6.00	Review of materials; response to various defense requests; communications with co-counsel; analysis of case; preparation
28-May-24	Ashong, M.	0.75	Attend team strategy meeting.
28-May-24	Davis, C.	1.50	Confer with counsel team regarding
28-May-24	Arnold, L.E.	2.50	Attend case team meeting to discuss to do list and next steps; work in connection with case management; review and respond to email correspondence with C. Davis regarding assistance researching Minnesota legal citation formats; work in connection re same; prepare copies of suggested citation formats for C. Davis for attorney review and analysis.
29-May-24	Maloney, K.G.	5.50	Review .
29-May-24	Poscablo, R.P.	2.00	Review .
29-May-24	Bromwich, M.R.	2.75	Review ; review ; emails with team members; video conference with K. Putney; telephone calls with P. Poscablo, S. Levin; emails with Shapiro.
29-May-24	Levin, S.H.	7.00	Review of materials; response to various defense requests; communications with co-counsel; analysis of case; preparation
29-May-24	Hernandez, B.	0.25	Scan document and share file to M. Ashong.
30-May-24	Maloney, K.G.	1.00	Telephone call with team to discuss events for next trip to Minnesota.
30-May-24	Maloney, K.G.	1.00	Begin drafting
30-May-24	Maloney, K.G.	1.75	Further edits to .
30-May-24	Maloney, K.G.	0.75	Telephone call with HCAO personnel and consultant.
30-May-24	Poscablo, R.P.	6.50	Review ; meeting with team to discuss telephone call with HCAO; review ; telephone call with client to email to K. Putney; review
30-May-24	Bromwich, M.R.	4.25	Develop and revise emails with team members; conference call with M. Moriarty and Hennepin County team.
30-May-24	Levin, S.H.	7.00	Review of materials; response to various defense requests; communications with co-counsel; analysis of case; preparation
30-May-24	Ashong, M.	3.00	Participate in

Date	Timekeeper	Hours	Description
30-May-24	Davis, C.	3.00	Draft and revise ; confer with client regarding same.
30-May-24	Arnold, L.E.	1.75	Review and respond to email correspondence with team regarding to do list; work in connection with preparing and researching blue book methods to citing to various sources in preparation for adding to citation chart, as per C. Davis.
31-May-24	Maloney, K.G.	2.00	Draft and make edits to .
31-May-24	Bromwich, M.R.	3.50	Telephone call with K. Maloney; draft and edit review; emails with team members.
31-May-24	Levin, S.H.	8.00	Review of materials; response to various defense requests; communications with co-counsel; analysis of case; preparation
31-May-24	Ashong, M.	6.00	Confer with BCA Special Agent T. Roth regarding Cobb airbag module; review and analyze ; draft and revise , draft and revise .
31-May-24	Arnold, L.E.	6.25	Review and respond to email correspondence with M. Ashong and C. Davis re regarding; work in connection with review and editing of a story review and revised draft to M. Ashong and C. Davis for attorney review and analysis.
1-Jun-24	Poscablo, R.P.	1.00	Emails with team regarding review
1-Jun-24	Bromwich, M.R.	2.75	Review and edit ; review and edit ; emails with M. Moriarty, S. Davis.
1-Jun-24	Levin, S.H.	2.00	Review of materials; response to various defense requests; communications with co-counsel; analysis of case; preparation
1-Jun-24	Davis, C.	3.00	Revise .
1-Jun-24	Arnold, L.E.	1.25	Review and respond to email correspondence with M. Bromwich and C. Davis regarding ; work in connection with review, analysis and editing of .
2-Jun-24	Maloney, K.G.	3.00	Revise and finalize ; calls with team members regarding same.
2-Jun-24	Maloney, K.G.	0.75	Participate in notification meeting with family of Ricky Cobb.
2-Jun-24	Poscablo, R.P.	4.75	Meeting with team; meeting with team to prepare for meetings with Hennepin County; call with S. Davis, M. Ashong and M. Bromwich; call with Hennepin County, counsel, team and others; call with team to discuss next steps.
2-Jun-24	Bromwich, M.R.	5.75	Telephone calls and texts with S Davis regarding ; video conference with Hennepin County Steptoe team and S. Davis; emails with team members; follow-up video conferences with S. Davis; emails and telephone calls with team members; emails with M. Ashong; meeting with Cobb family members; follow-up video conferences and emails.
2-Jun-24	Levin, S.H.	3.50	Review of materials; response to various defense requests; communications with co-counsel; analysis of case; preparation and telephone call with family.
2-Jun-24	Adibi, I.	4.50	Assist with revisions to .
2-Jun-24	Ashong, M.	8.50	Draft ; participate in meeting with client and Cobb family.

Date	Timekeeper	Hours	Description
2-Jun-24	Davis, C.	6.00	Revise
2-Jun-24	Arnold, L.E.	7.50	Attend Zoom meeting with Steptoe team regarding ; review and respond to email correspondence
			with M. Bromwich, M. Ashong, C. Davis and I. Adibi regarding ; work in connection with
3-Jun-24	Maloney, K.G.	4.00	Additional edits to and call with HCAO.
3-Jun-24	Poscablo, R.P.	2.00	Press conference, discussion with team regarding
3-Jun-24	Bromwich, M.R.	4.50	Emails with team members; watch Moriarty press conference; telephone calls with S. Davis; conference call with S. Davis, C. Diegel, K. Maloney; review ; telephone calls with K. Maloney.
3-Jun-24	Levin, S.H.	1.00	Work on
3-Jun-24	Ashong, M.	6.50	; confer with K. Maloney, M. Bromwich, S. Levin, C. Davis, I. Adibi, L. Arnold regarding same.
3-Jun-24	Davis, C.	4.00	Revise
3-Jun-24	Arnold, L.E.	7.75	Attend Zoom meeting with Steptoe associate team regarding
			; review and respond to email correspondence with M. Ashong, C. Davis and I. Adibi regarding ; work in connection with
4-Jun-24	Maloney, K.G.	3.00	Video conference regarding
4-Jun-24	Poscablo, R.P.	1.00	Teephone call with team to discuss
4-Jun-24	Bromwich, M.R.	3.75	Video-conference regarding ; telephone calls and emails with team members regarding ; emails with M. Moriarty, S. Davis; logistics regarding .
4-Jun-24	Levin, S.H.	2.00	Assist with the draft of
4-Jun-24	Adibi, I.	2.00	Implement .
4-Jun-24	Ashong, M.	6.50	Draft and finalize .
4-Jun-24	Davis, C.	5.00	Revise .
4-Jun-24	Arnold, L.E.	5.00	Attend Zoom meeting with Steptoe Associate team regarding ; review and respond to email correspondence with M. Ashong, C. Davis and I. Adibi regarding
			; work in connection with
5-Jun-24	Bromwich, M.R.	1.25	Emails with team members; emails with C. Davis; administrative matters.
5-Jun-24	Ashong, M.	0.50	Confer with K. Maloney and L. Arnold regarding
5-Jun-24	Arnold, L.E.	0.75	Continue work in connection with ; review and respond to email correspondence with M. Ashong, M. Bromwich and C. Davis regarding same; work in connection with case management.
6-Jun-24	Ashong, M.	0.25	Confer with C. Diegel regarding

Date	Timekeeper	Hours	Description	
6-Jun-24	Arnold, L.E.	1.00	Work in connection with case management; clean up outlook files and organize LEA working files on desktop.	
10-Jun-24	Bromwich, M.R.	0.25	Emails and texts with C. Davis, team members.	
10-Jun-24	Arnold, L.E.	1.50	Review and respond to email correspondence with M. Bromwich and M. Ashong regarding ; draft email to M. Bromwich forwarding ; work in connection with preparation of PDFs of exhibits for printing and binding, as per M. Bromwich; prepare exhibit volume cover sheets 1-3; draft email to copy request form and instructions for printing copy sets for M. Bromwich; work in connection with case management.	
	T . •	605.00		

Total 625.20

EXPENSE DETAIL

Description	Amount
Certificate of Good Standing on 2024-05-07 - Michael Bromwich, DC Bar, Obtain Certificate of Good Standing to support filing for client in court.	25.69
Certificate of Good Standing on 2024-05-09 - Steven Levin, Supreme Court of Maryland, Obtain Maryland Certificate of Good Standing	8.14
Agent Fee on 2024-05-06 - Michael Bromwich, Lawyers Travel, Attend meetings with client in Hennepin County.	42.25
Taxi on 2024-05-14 - Michael Bromwich, Uber, Washington, District of Columbia, from Home to DCA Airport, Attend meetings with client in Hennepin County.	43.15
Lodging on 2024-05-14 - Michael Bromwich, Radisson Hotels, Radisson Hotels, Minneapolis, Minnesota, Attend meetings with client in Hennepin County.	155.51
Lunch on 2024-05-14 - Steven Levin, Smoothie King, Baltimore, Maryland, Lunch during meetings and court appearance in Minnesota	11.44
Dinner on 2024-05-14 - Steven Levin, Canopy by Hilton, Minneapolis, Minnesota, Dinner during meetings and court appearance in Minnesota	43.30
Car Service on 2024-05-14 - Myles Ashong, Uber, Travel from airport after traveling to meet with client and appear on behalf of client in Hennepin County court.	81.93
Lodging on 2024-05-14 - Myles Ashong, Radisson Hotels, Radisson Red Minneapolis Downtown, Minneapolis, Minnesota, Travel from airport after traveling to meet with client and appear on behalf of client in Hennepin County court.	267.45
Lodging on 2024-05-14 - Michael Bromwich, Radisson Hotels, Radisson Hotels, Minneapolis, Minnesota, Attend meetings with client in Hennepin County.	256.74
Airfare - Myles Ashong, Delta Air Lines Inc., to New York City, New York, Departure Date: 2024-05-14, Travel to meet with client and appear on behalf of client in Hennepin County court., Ticket No:	387.20
Lodging on 2024-05-14 - Karima Maloney, Radisson Hotels, RED Radisson, Minneapolis, Minnesota, Meeting with Hennepin County	321.00
Lodging on 2024-05-14 - Karima Maloney, Radisson Hotels, RED Radisson, Minneapolis, Minnesota, Meeting with Hennepin County	48.23
Airfare - Karima Maloney, United Airlines, to Minneapolis, Minnesota, Departure Date: 2024-05-14, Meeting with Hennepin County, Ticket No:	965.20

Description	Amount
Airfare - Steven Levin, Delta Air Lines Inc., to Baltimore, Maryland, Departure Date: 2024-05-14, Roundtrip airfare re meetings and court appearance in Minnesota, Ticket No:	462.00
Baggage Fee on 2024-05-14 - Steven Levin, Delta Airlines, Baggage fees re meetings and court appearance in Minnesota	35.00
Lodging on 2024-05-14 - Steven Levin, Radisson Hotels, Radisson RED Minneapolis, Minneapolis, Minnesota, Hotel charges during meetings and court appearance in Minnesota	314.80
Car Service on 2024-05-14 - Myles Ashong, Uber, Travel to airport to meet with client and appear on behalf of client in Hennepin County court.	59.42
Airfare - Ryan Poscablo, Delta Air Lines Inc., to Minneapolis, Minnesota, Departure Date: 2024-05-15, Travel to Minnesota re Hennepin County., Ticket No:	304.10
Lodging on 2024-05-14 - Karima Maloney, Radisson Hotels, RED Radisson, Minneapolis, Minnesota, Meeting with Hennepin County	321.00
Lodging on 2024-05-14 - Karima Maloney, Radisson Hotels, RED Radisson, Minneapolis, Minnesota, Meeting with Hennepin County	48.23
Lodging on 2024-05-15 - Steven Levin, Radisson Hotels, Radisson RED Minneapolis, Minneapolis, Minnesota, Hotel charges during meetings and court appearance in Minnesota	189.29
Taxi on 2024-05-16 - Michael Bromwich, VIP Cab, Washington, District of Columbia, from DCA to Home, Attend meetings with client in Hennepin County.	30.76
Airfare - Michael Bromwich, Delta Air Lines Inc., to Minneapolis, Minnesota, Departure Date: 2024-05-16, Attend meetings with client in Hennepin County., Ticket No:	306.38
Agent Fee on 2024-05-16 - Michael Bromwich, Lawyers Travel, Attend meetings with client in Hennepin County.	42.25
Airfare - Michael Bromwich, Delta Air Lines Inc., to Minneapolis, Minnesota, Departure Date: 2024-05- 16, Attend meetings with client in Hennepin County., Ticket No:	404.94
Lunch on 2024-05-16 - Michael Bromwich, Hissho Sushi, Minneapolis, Minnesota, Attend meetings with client in Hennepin County.	22.54
Baggage Fee on 2024-05-16 - Steven Levin, Delta Airlines, Baggage fees during meetings and court appearance in Minnesota	35.00
Lunch on 2024-05-16 - Steven Levin, MSP Bottle Rocket, Saint Paul, Minnesota, Lunch during meetings and court appearance in Minnesota	33.31
Parking on 2024-05-16 - Steven Levin, Parking, Baltimore, Maryland, Parking fee following travel to Minnesota for meetings and court appearance	52.00
Airfare - Ryan Poscablo, Delta Air Lines Inc., to New York, New York, Departure Date: 2024-05-17, Travel to Minnesota re Hennepin County., Ticket No:	293.10
Experts - DATE: 2024-06- 05 RE: expert services	8,400.00
Litigation Support Vendors - Project Management DATE: 2024-06-27 RE:	1,996.50
Total	\$16,007,95

Total \$16,007.85



717 TEXAS AVENUE, SUITE 2800

Houston, TX 77002 TEL: 202.429.3000 www.steptoe.com

11 July 2024

HENNEPIN COUNTY ATTORNEY 300 South Sixth Street Minneapolis, MN 55487 UNITED STATES

INVOICE SUMMARY

Our Matter No. 126344.00001 Invoice No. 30079440

Hennepin County Steptoe May-June Invoice

For professional services in connection with the above matter.

Total Fees	\$	482,550.00
Total Expenses		16,007.85
Total Amount Due	\$	498,557.85

INVOICE IS DUE AND PAYABLE UPON RECEIPT PLEASE RETURN THIS COPY WITH YOUR REMITTANCE

Please send remittance to:

Steptoe LLP PO Box 603212 Charlotte, NC 28260-3212 Wiring Instructions: Bank:

, Washington, DC

Domestic Wire Transfers: ABA#:
Domestic ACH Transactions: ABA#:

Beneficiary's Account #

Swift Code – CHIPS –

Beneficiary's Name:

Limited Liability Partnership under the laws of the District of Columbia, U.S.A.

Tax ID Number